



DEPARTMENT: CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE
 DEMOLITION AND REMOVAL OF DILAPIDATED STRUCTURE: 214 N. MAIN STREET

DECEMBER 11, 2019 3:00 P.M.
 CITY BID #10 19/20

BIDDER NAME AND ADDRESS:	TOTAL BID	ESTIMATED NUMBER OF DAYS
Kern's Construction, 1805 S. Perkins Rd., Stillwater, OK	NO BID	
Level Excavation LLC, 414 Flynn, Alva, OK	\$17,952.00	30
M.K. Excavation, LLC, PO Box 863, Stillwater OK	\$17,250.00	45
Enfield Demolition & Excavation, LLC, 1602 Foxcroft, Enid, OK	\$14,162.00	30
DT Specialized Services, Inc., PO Box 610, Catoosa, OK	\$17,374.99	5
Total Demolition Services, LLC, 11600 W. Hwy 33, Guthrie, OK	\$19,168.00	10

As read during bid opening.

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED TIME

AND DATE:

TERESA KADAVY
 VICKI REED

JIM SCOTT
 MELODY HERNDON

MICHELLE WILHELM
 DENNIS MCGRATH



DEPARTMENT: CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE
 DEMOLITION AND REMOVAL OF DILAPIDATED STRUCTURE: 216 N. MAIN STREET

DECEMBER 11, 2019 3:00 P.M.
 CITY BID #10 19/20

BIDDER NAME AND ADDRESS:	TOTAL BID	ESTIMATED NUMBER OF DAYS
Kern's Construction, 1805 S. Perkins Rd., Stillwater, OK	NO BID	
Level Excavation LLC, 414 Flynn, Alva, OK	\$12,000.00	30
M.K. Excavation, LLC, PO Box 863, Stillwater OK	\$17,250.00	45
Enfield Demolition & Excavation, LLC, 1602 Foxcroft, Enid, OK	\$22,489.00	30
DT Specialized Services, Inc., PO Box 610, Catoosa, OK	\$29,390.89	8
Total Demolition Services, LLC, 11600 W. Hwy 33, Guthrie, OK	\$35,899.00	20

As read during bid opening.

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED TIME

AND DATE:

TERESA KADAVY
 VICKI REED

JIM SCOTT
 MELODY HERNDON

MICHELLE WILHELM
 DENNIS MCGRATH



502 S Lowry

DEPARTMENT: CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE	DECEMBER 11, 2019 3:00 P.M. CITY BID #10 19/20
DEMOLITION AND REMOVAL OF DILAPIDATED STRUCTURE: 502 S. LOWRY	

BIDDER NAME AND ADDRESS:	TOTAL BID	ESTIMATED NUMBER OF DAYS
Kern's Construction, 1805 S. Perkins Rd., Stillwater, OK	\$20,500.00	7
Level Excavation LLC, 414 Flynn, Alva, OK	\$6,768.00	30
M.K. Excavation, LLC, PO Box 863, Stillwater OK	\$9,800.00	45
Enfield Demolition & Excavation, LLC, 1602 Foxcroft, Enid, OK	\$8,718.00	30
DT Specialized Services, Inc., PO Box 610, Catoosa, OK	\$11,784.08	7
Total Demolition Services, LLC, 11600 W. Hwy 33, Guthrie, OK	\$17,322.00	10

As read during bid opening.

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED TIME

AND DATE:

TERESA KADAVY
VICKI REED

JIM SCOTT
MELISSA HERNDON

MICHELLE WILHELM
DENNIS MCGRATH



506 S Lowry

DEPARTMENT: CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE	DECEMBER 11, 2019 3:00 P.M. CITY BID #10 19/20
DEMOLITION AND REMOVAL OF DILAPIDATED STRUCTURE: 506 S. LOWRY	

BIDDER NAME AND ADDRESS:	TOTAL BID	ESTIMATED NUMBER OF DAYS
Kern's Construction, 1805 S. Perkins Rd., Stillwater, OK	\$27,950.00	6
Level Excavation LLC, 414 Flynn, Alva, OK	\$6,500.00	30
M.K. Excavation, LLC, PO Box 863, Stillwater OK	\$14,600.00	45
Enfield Demolition & Excavation, LLC, 1602 Foxcroft, Enid, OK	\$7,117.00	30
DT Specialized Services, Inc., PO Box 610, Catoosa, OK	\$13,636.35	5
Total Demolition Services, LLC, 11600 W. Hwy 33, Guthrie, OK	\$15,231.00	10

As read during bid opening.

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED TIME

AND DATE:

TERESA KADAVY
VICKI REED

JIM SCOTT
MELBA HERNDON

MICHELLE WILHELM
DENNIS MCGRATH



4920 N Washington

DEPARTMENT: CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE	DECEMBER 11, 2019 3:00 P.M. CITY BID #10 19/20
DEMOLITION AND REMOVAL OF DILAPIDATED STRUCTURE: 4920 N. WASHINGTON STREET	

BIDDER NAME AND ADDRESS:	TOTAL BID	ESTIMATED NUMBER OF DAYS
Kern's Construction, 1805 S. Perkins Rd., Stillwater, OK	NO BID	
Level Excavation LLC, 414 Flynn, Alva, OK	\$34,256.00	30
M.K. Excavation, LLC, PO Box 863, Stillwater OK	\$34,350.00	45
Enfield Demolition & Excavation, LLC, 1602 Foxcroft, Enid, OK	\$75,712.00	45-60
DT Specialized Services, Inc., PO Box 610, Catoosa, OK	\$73,863.58	14
Total Demolition Services, LLC, 11600 W. Hwy 33, Guthrie, OK	\$98,977.00	30

As read during bid opening.

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED TIME

AND DATE:

TERESA KADAVY
VICKI REED

JIM SCOTT
MELISSA HERNDON

MICHELLE WILHELM
DENNIS MCGRATH



1023 W 10th Ave

DEPARTMENT: CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE
 DEMOLITION AND REMOVAL OF DILAPIDATED STRUCTURE: 1023 W. 10TH AVENUE

DECEMBER 11, 2019 3:00 P.M.
 CITY BID #10 19/20

BIDDER NAME AND ADDRESS:	TOTAL BID	ESTIMATED NUMBER OF DAYS
Kern's Construction, 1805 S. Perkins Rd., Stillwater, OK	NO BID	
Level Excavation LLC, 414 Flynn, Alva, OK	\$4,800.00	30
M.K. Excavation, LLC, PO Box 863, Stillwater OK	\$9,800.00	45
Enfield Demolition & Excavation, LLC, 1602 Foxcroft, Enid, OK	\$6,796.00	30
DT Specialized Services, Inc., PO Box 610, Catoosa, OK	\$6,818.18	4
Total Demolition Services, LLC, 11600 W. Hwy 33, Guthrie, OK	\$11,826.00	10

As read during bid opening.

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED TIME

AND DATE:

TERESA KADAVY
 VICKI REED

JIM SCOTT
 MELISSA HERNDON

MICHELLE WILHELM
 DENNIS MCGRATH