

STILL PIONEERING

DEPARTMENT: WATER RESOURCES-WATER TREATMENT PLANT	DATE/TIME: 06/13/2016 3:00 p.m.
DESCRIPTION: THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS TO THE STILLWATER WATER TREATMENT PLANT	SUA BID #21-15/16

		LIQUID ALUMINUM SULFATE	CHLORINE GAS	CARBON DIOXIDE	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	POLYMER (COAGULANT AIDE)	ANHYDROUS AMMONIA	LIQUID OXYGEN
BIDDER:	UNIT	PER DRY TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER LB	PER LB	PER LB	PER 100 SCF
Kemira Water Solutions Inc., 4321 West 6th Street, Lawrence, KS								
PO BID PRICE:	NO BID							
CC BID PRICE:	NO BID							
Brenntag Southwest Inc., RR 2 Box 352-200, Nowata, OK								
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 369.2000	\$ 559.6000		\$ 0.4995	\$ 0.3998		
CC BID PRICE:		\$ 369.2000	\$ 559.6000		\$ 0.4995	\$ 0.3998		
Chameleon Industries Inc., PO Box 853027, Mesquite, TX								
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 298.0000						
CC BID PRICE:		\$ 315.0000						
Affinity Chemical LLC, PO Box 601298, Dallas, TX								
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 224.0000						
CC BID PRICE:		\$ 228.0000						
Southwest Chemical Services Inc., PO Box 1245, McAlester, OK								
PO BID PRICE:					\$ 0.4800		\$ 0.9200	
CC BID PRICE:					NO BID		NO BID	
Praxair Inc., 7000 High Grove Boulevard, Burr Ridge, IL								
PO BID PRICE:				\$ 160.0000				\$ 0.4490
CC BID PRICE:				NO BID				NO BID

STAFF PRESENT AT BID OPENING:	ELIZABETH CHRZ, VICKI REED, BILL MILLIS, CANDY STARING, ALLY JONES
-------------------------------	--

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED DATE AND TIME.

STILL PIONEERING

DEPARTMENT: WATER RESOURCES-WATER TREATMENT PLANT	DATE/TIME: 06/13/2016 3:00 p.m.
DESCRIPTION: THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS TO THE STILLWATER WATER TREATMENT PLANT	SUA BID #21-15/16

		LIQUID ALUMINUM SULFATE	CHLORINE GAS	CARBON DIOXIDE	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	POLYMER (COAGULANT AIDE)	ANHYDROUS AMMONIA	LIQUID OXYGEN
BIDDER:	UNIT	PER DRY TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER LB	PER LB	PER LB	PER 100 SCF
Hawkins Inc., 2381 Rosegate, Roseville, MN								
PO BID PRICE:					\$ 0.5100	\$ 0.5600		
CC BID PRICE:					\$ 0.5100	\$ 0.5600		
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC, 90 East Halsey Road, Parsippany, NJ								
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 239.0000						
CC BID PRICE:		NO BID						
Polydyne Inc., 1 Chemical Plant Road, Riceboro, GA								
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 0.3990		
CC BID PRICE:						\$ 0.3990		
Univar USA Inc., 8201 S. 212th, Kent, WA								
PO BID PRICE:	NO BID							
CC BID PRICE:	NO BID							
NALCO Company, 1601 West Diehl Road, Naperville, IL								
PO BID PRICE:						\$ 0.7400		
CC BID PRICE:						\$ 0.7400		
Air Products and Chemicals Inc., 7201 Hamilton Blvd, Allentown, PA								
PO BID PRICE:								\$ 0.3000
CC BID PRICE:								NO BID

STAFF PRESENT AT BID OPENING: ELIZABETH CHRZ, VICKI REED, BILL MILLIS, CANDY STARING, ALLY JONES

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED DATE AND TIME.

STILL PIONEERING

DEPARTMENT: WATER RESOURCES-WATER TREATMENT PLANT      DATE/TIME: 06/13/2016 3:00 p.m.  
 DESCRIPTION: THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS TO THE STILLWATER WATER TREATMENT PLANT      SUA BID #21-15/16

		LIQUID ALUMINUM SULFATE	CHLORINE GAS	CARBON DIOXIDE	SODIUM SILICOFLUORIDE	POLYMER (COAGULANT AIDE)	ANHYDROUS AMMONIA	LIQUID OXYGEN
BIDDER:	UNIT	PER DRY TON	PER TON	PER TON	PER LB	PER LB	PER LB	PER 100 SCF
GEO Specialty Chemicals Inc., 9213 Arch Street Pike, Little Rock, AR								
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 477.7000						
CC BID PRICE:		\$ 477.7000						
Airgas USA LLC, 2607 E 6th Street, Stillwater, OK								
PO BID PRICE:				\$ 129.0000				\$ 0.4500
CC BID PRICE:				NO BID				NO BID
DPC Enterprise, 3105 N Mead, Wichita, KS								
PO BID PRICE:			\$ 900.0000					
CC BID PRICE:			\$ 900.0000					
Harcros Chemicals, 3810 S Elwood, Tulsa, OK								
PO BID PRICE:		\$ 425.0000			\$ 0.4875			
CC BID PRICE:		NO BID			NO BID			
Airgas Specialty Products, 2530 Sever Rd, Ste 300, Laurenceville, GA								
PO BID PRICE:							\$ 0.8400	
CC BID PRICE:							\$ 0.8400	
PO BID PRICE:								
CC BID PRICE:								

STAFF PRESENT AT BID OPENING:      ELIZABETH CHRZ, VICKI REED, BILL MILLIS, CANDY STARING, ALLY JONES

THE SEALED BIDS AS LISTED WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD AT THE ABOVE LISTED DATE AND TIME.